
Library Calendar

Tuesday, April 1, 2025

Preschool Story Time

Date and Time: Tuesday, April 1 10:30 am - 11:30 am

Address: 180 SHARPE ST W, Gravenhurst

Join Miss Jenn every Tuesday morning for songs, stories, sensory centers and literacy activities, perfect for your
preschooler!

Tuesdays | 10:30am - 11:30am

Age: 18 months - 4 years (younger/older siblings welcome)

Drop In Program

Tech Tuesdays

Date and Time: Tuesday, April 1 3:30 pm - 4:30 pm

Address: 180 SHARPE ST W, Gravenhurst

Join us for an exciting kids' drop-in where creativity meets technology! Explore the world of coding, robotics, s
top motion animation, and more. Perfect for young minds eager to learn and have fun while developing new ski
lls in a hands-on, interactive environment.

Tuesdays | 3:30pm - 4:30pm

Ages: 4-12 years

Drop In Program

Wednesday, April 2, 2025

Dementia-Friendly Communities

Date and Time: Wednesday, April 2 11:00 am - 12:00 pm

Address: 180 SHARPE ST W, Gravenhurst

This education session is a 1-part introductory session covering the following:

-What is a dementia-friendly community?



-Resources with tips to help you take action

-Common signs of dementia and strategies for action

Kids' Club: Inspiring Artists

Date and Time: Wednesday, April 2 4:00 pm - 5:00 pm

Address: 180 SHARPE ST W, Gravenhurst

Join us for an exciting kids' drop-in where creativity meets technology! Explore the world of coding, robotics, s
top motion animation, and more. Perfect for young minds eager to learn and have fun while developing new ski
lls in a hands-on, interactive environment.

Tween Scene: Paint Pictionary

Date and Time: Wednesday, April 2 6:00 pm - 7:00 pm

Address: 180 SHARPE ST W, Gravenhurst

Play pictionary with finger paint at our first April Tween Scene session!

Age: 8-12 years

*Weekly Registration Required

Friday, April 4, 2025

Baby Bop

Date and Time: Friday, April 4 10:30 am - 11:30 am

Address: 180 SHARPE ST W, Gravenhurst

Come to the Library for Baby Story Hour every Friday! Make new friends as you explore sensory activities, rea
d books, sing songs and learn new lap bounces.

Fridays | 10:30am - 11:30am

Age: Newborn - 2 years (older siblings are also welcome)

Drop In Program

Tuesday, April 8, 2025

Preschool Story Time



Date and Time: Tuesday, April 8 10:30 am - 11:30 am

Address: 180 SHARPE ST W, Gravenhurst

Join Miss Jenn every Tuesday morning for songs, stories, sensory centers and literacy activities, perfect for your
preschooler!

Tuesdays | 10:30am - 11:30am

Age: 18 months - 4 years (younger/older siblings welcome)

Drop In Program

Tech Tuesdays

Date and Time: Tuesday, April 8 3:30 pm - 4:30 pm

Address: 180 SHARPE ST W, Gravenhurst

Join us for an exciting kids' drop-in where creativity meets technology! Explore the world of coding, robotics, s
top motion animation, and more. Perfect for young minds eager to learn and have fun while developing new ski
lls in a hands-on, interactive environment.

Tuesdays | 3:30pm - 4:30pm

Ages: 4-12 years

Drop In Program

Wednesday, April 9, 2025

Kids' Club: Inspiring Artists

Date and Time: Wednesday, April 9 4:00 pm - 5:00 pm

Address: 180 SHARPE ST W, Gravenhurst

Join us for an exciting kids' drop-in where creativity meets technology! Explore the world of coding, robotics, s
top motion animation, and more. Perfect for young minds eager to learn and have fun while developing new ski
lls in a hands-on, interactive environment.

Friday, April 11, 2025

Baby Bop

Date and Time: Friday, April 11 10:30 am - 11:30 am

Address: 180 SHARPE ST W, Gravenhurst



Come to the Library for Baby Story Hour every Friday! Make new friends as you explore sensory activities, rea
d books, sing songs and learn new lap bounces.

Fridays | 10:30am - 11:30am

Age: Newborn - 2 years (older siblings are also welcome)

Drop In Program

Monday, April 14, 2025

Adult Crafts: Spring Signs

Date and Time: Monday, April 14 2:00 pm - 3:00 pm

Address: 180 SHARPE ST W, Gravenhurst

Join us to create spring signs. We will guide you through the process of designing and assembling beautiful sig
ns perfect for brightening up any space. Whether you're an experienced crafter or just starting out, this worksho
p offers a welcoming environment where you can express your creativity and learn new techniques. All material
s will be provided. Come along for an afternoon of fun, inspiration, and the joy of making something uniquely 
yours!

Registration Required

Teen Cricut

Date and Time: Monday, April 14 3:30 pm - 4:30 pm

Address: 180 SHARPE ST W, Gravenhurst

Create eye-catching holographic stickers using the Cricut this April! Design your own images or choose from t
emplates, then let the machine cut them with precision. Peel, stick, and show off your custom creations! 

Monday, April 14th | 3:30pm - 5pm

Ages: 12-18 years

Drop In Program

Tuesday, April 15, 2025

Preschool Story Time

Date and Time: Tuesday, April 15 10:30 am - 11:30 am

Address: 180 SHARPE ST W, Gravenhurst



Join Miss Jenn every Tuesday morning for songs, stories, sensory centers and literacy activities, perfect for your
preschooler!

Tuesdays | 10:30am - 11:30am

Age: 18 months - 4 years (younger/older siblings welcome)

Drop In Program

Tech Tuesdays

Date and Time: Tuesday, April 15 3:30 pm - 4:30 pm

Address: 180 SHARPE ST W, Gravenhurst

Join us for an exciting kids' drop-in where creativity meets technology! Explore the world of coding, robotics, s
top motion animation, and more. Perfect for young minds eager to learn and have fun while developing new ski
lls in a hands-on, interactive environment.

Tuesdays | 3:30pm - 4:30pm

Ages: 4-12 years

Drop In Program

Wednesday, April 16, 2025

Kids' Club: Inspiring Artists

Date and Time: Wednesday, April 16 4:00 pm - 5:00 pm

Address: 180 SHARPE ST W, Gravenhurst

Join us for an exciting kids' drop-in where creativity meets technology! Explore the world of coding, robotics, s
top motion animation, and more. Perfect for young minds eager to learn and have fun while developing new ski
lls in a hands-on, interactive environment.

Tween Scene: Egg Olympics

Date and Time: Wednesday, April 16 6:00 pm - 7:00 pm

Address: 180 SHARPE ST W, Gravenhurst

Get ready to fry up some fun at the Egg Olympics, where tweens compete in exciting, egg-cellent events for the 
ultimate championship!

Age: 8-12 years

*Weekly Registration Required



Thursday, April 17, 2025

Muskoka Discovery Centre Community Day Story Time

Date and Time: Thursday, April 17 10:00 am - 12:00 pm

Address: 275 Steamship Bay Rd

Join Miss Jenn at the Muskoka Discovery Centre to read rowing stories, craft model canoes, and build your ow
n floating boat! 

Thursday, April 17th | 10am -12pm

Age: Children and Families

Drop In (pay-what-you-can for Discovery Centre admission)

Location: Muskoka Discovery Centre

Adult Board Game Night

Date and Time: Thursday, April 17 6:00 pm - 8:00 pm

Address: 180 SHARPE ST W, Gravenhurst

Feeling “board”? We have the perfect solution for you! Join our Adult Board Game group, where we gather on
ce a month for an evening brimming with fun, laughter, and the opportunity to discover new games. You're wel
come to bring along your favorite board game. No experience needed. We'll guide you to become a board game 
pro in no time!

Drop In Program

Saturday, April 19, 2025

Easter Story Time

Date and Time: Saturday, April 19 10:30 am - 11:30 am

Address: 180 SHARPE ST W, Gravenhurst

Hop on over to the Library this Easter Weekend for an Epic Easter Story Time! Search for baby chicks and hidde
n eggs, create fabulous spring crafts, and of course, read an awesome Easter story.

Saturday, April 19th | 10:30am - 11:30am

Age: Children and Families

Drop In Program



Tuesday, April 22, 2025

Preschool Story Time

Date and Time: Tuesday, April 22 10:30 am - 11:30 am

Address: 180 SHARPE ST W, Gravenhurst

Join Miss Jenn every Tuesday morning for songs, stories, sensory centers and literacy activities, perfect for your
preschooler!

Tuesdays | 10:30am - 11:30am

Age: 18 months - 4 years (younger/older siblings welcome)

Drop In Program

Tech Tuesdays

Date and Time: Tuesday, April 22 3:30 pm - 4:30 pm

Address: 180 SHARPE ST W, Gravenhurst

Join us for an exciting kids' drop-in where creativity meets technology! Explore the world of coding, robotics, s
top motion animation, and more. Perfect for young minds eager to learn and have fun while developing new ski
lls in a hands-on, interactive environment.

Tuesdays | 3:30pm - 4:30pm

Ages: 4-12 years

Drop In Program

Wednesday, April 23, 2025

Kids' Club: Inspiring Artists

Date and Time: Wednesday, April 23 4:00 pm - 5:00 pm

Address: 180 SHARPE ST W, Gravenhurst

Join us for an exciting kids' drop-in where creativity meets technology! Explore the world of coding, robotics, s
top motion animation, and more. Perfect for young minds eager to learn and have fun while developing new ski
lls in a hands-on, interactive environment.

Gravenhurst: A History



Date and Time: Wednesday, April 23 6:30 pm - 7:30 pm

Address: 180 SHARPE ST W, Gravenhurst

Join us for an engaging exploration into the past of Gravenhurst, a town rich in history and stories waiting to be
uncovered. We will delve into the fascinating events and people that have shaped the community over the years. 
Whether you're a lifelong resident or new to the area, this talk offers a unique opportunity to connect with the h
eritage of Gravenhurst. Come and discover the intriguing tales and historical insights that make this town so sp
ecial.

Drop in or Virtual via Zoom (please register if participating virtually)

Thursday, April 24, 2025

Nutritious Food Basket Study

Date and Time: Thursday, April 24 2:00 pm - 3:00 pm

Address: 180 SHARPE ST W, Gravenhurst

Each year the Simcoe Muskoka District Health Unit conducts the Nutritious Food Basket (NFB) survey. Local 
food cost data is used to estimate how affordable housing and basic nutritious food is when compared to incom
e. In this interesting presentation Public Health Nurse, Susan Reese, will talk about the results of the survey, the
issue of food insecurity, and how it can be addressed.

Friday, April 25, 2025

Baby Bop: Music with Miss Mandy

Date and Time: Friday, April 25 10:30 am - 11:30 am

Address: 180 SHARPE ST W, Gravenhurst Public Library

Join the marvelous Miss Mandy for a magical morning of music perfect for your little one!

Fridays | 10:30am - 11:30am

Age: Newborn - 2 years (older siblings are also welcome)

Drop In Program

Tuesday, April 29, 2025

Preschool Story Time



Date and Time: Tuesday, April 29 10:30 am - 11:30 am

Address: 180 SHARPE ST W, Gravenhurst

Join Miss Jenn every Tuesday morning for songs, stories, sensory centers and literacy activities, perfect for your
preschooler!

Tuesdays | 10:30am - 11:30am

Age: 18 months - 4 years (younger/older siblings welcome)

Drop In Program

Tech Tuesdays

Date and Time: Tuesday, April 29 3:30 pm - 4:30 pm

Address: 180 SHARPE ST W, Gravenhurst

Join us for an exciting kids' drop-in where creativity meets technology! Explore the world of coding, robotics, s
top motion animation, and more. Perfect for young minds eager to learn and have fun while developing new ski
lls in a hands-on, interactive environment.

Tuesdays | 3:30pm - 4:30pm

Ages: 4-12 years

Drop In Program

Wednesday, April 30, 2025

Muskoka Climate Change

Date and Time: Wednesday, April 30 2:00 pm - 3:00 pm

Address: 180 SHARPE ST W, Gravenhurst

Join Lauren Saville from the District of Muskoka to learn about the effects of climate change in Muskoka. She 
will be discussing the measures being implemented by the District, and the steps residents can take to either miti
gate the impacts or adapt to the shifting climate. Lauren will also introduce information about the Climate Her
o community climate engagement program.

 

Kids' Club: Inspiring Artists

Date and Time: Wednesday, April 30 4:00 pm - 5:00 pm

Address: 180 SHARPE ST W, Gravenhurst



https://events.gravenhurst.ca

Join us for an exciting kids' drop-in where creativity meets technology! Explore the world of coding, robotics, s
top motion animation, and more. Perfect for young minds eager to learn and have fun while developing new ski
lls in a hands-on, interactive environment.

Tween Scene: Fuzzy Friends

Date and Time: Wednesday, April 30 6:00 pm - 7:00 pm

Address: 180 SHARPE ST W, Gravenhurst

Bring your imagination to life with our upcoming Fuzzy Friends program. Create adorable animal portraits usi
ng fuzzy yarn and simple sewing techniques in this fun and fresh program!

Age: 8-12 years

*Weekly Registration Required

https://events.gravenhurst.ca

